ADOPTED REGULATION OF THE
STATE BOARD OF HEALTH
L CB File No. R100-07

Effective October 31, 2007

EXPLANATION — Matter in italicsis new; matter in brackets [emitted-material] is material to be omitted.

AUTHORITY': 881-7 and 16-43, NRS 439.200 and 444.650; 88, NRS 439.200 and 444.020; 8§89
and 10, NRS 439.150, 439.200 and 444.070; §811-13, NRS 439.150 and
439.200; 8814 and 15, NRS 439.200 and 444.335.

A REGULATION relating to health; increasing certain fees; revising certain provisions
regarding sterilization of used bedding, lighting in schools, and sewage disposal; and
providing other matters properly relating thereto.

Section 1. Chapter 444 of NAC is hereby amended by adding thereto the provisions set
forth as sections 2 to 7, inclusive, of this regulation.

Sec. 2. “Accessory structure’” means a building or structure, including, without
limitation, a workshop, a home office, guest quarters, a pool house and a garage, that:

1. Isseparatefrom asingle-family dwelling; and

2. Doesnot include both a bathroom unit and a kitchen unit.

Sec. 3. “Approved service provider” means a person approved by the administrative
authority to provide maintenance on an alternative treatment system.

Sec. 4. “Bathroom unit” means an area of a single-family dwelling or accessory
structure which includes a toilet, a sink, and a bathtub or a shower.

Sec. 5. “Drainage channel” meansa natural or man-made ditch that experiences

intermittent water flow from storms or runoff from melting snow.

--1--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



Sec. 6. “Kitchen unit” means an area of a structure which includes a cooking stove, a
refrigerator and a sink.

Sec. 7. 1. An accessory structure may be allowed to plumb into an individual sewage
disposal system that serves a single-family dwelling if:

(&) The accessory structureisused in conjunction with the single-family dwelling; and

(b) The septic tank has sufficient capacity to accommodate the total number of fixturesin

the accessory structure and the single-family dwelling, as determined by the following table:

TYPE OF FIXTURE FIXTURE UNITS
Bathtub 2
Bidet 2
Drinking fountain 1
Floor drain 2
I nterceptor:

For items such as grease, oil or solids 3
Laundry tub 2
Machine for washing clothes 2
Sewer connection for arecreational vehicle 6
Shower, single stall 2
Sink:

Bar, private (1 1/2-inch or 38.1-millimeter minimum 1
waste)

D

Adopted Regulation R100-07



TYPE OF FIXTURE FIXTURE UNITS

Bathroom (single) 1
Bathroom (double) 2
Kitchen, with or without dishwasher (2-inch or 50.8- 2

millimeter minimum waste)

Service 3
Toilet 6
Urinal 2

2. For the purposes of this section, each fixture unit must be rated at 25 gallons.

Sec. 8. NAC 444.002 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444,002 Sterilization or disinfection of used or secondhand articles listed in NAC 444.001
must be by one of the following methods, under the conditions outlined:

1. By thorough washing and sterilization by prolonged boiling for at least 1 hour.

2. By steam under 15 pounds pressure for at least 30 minutes. A gauge for registering steam
pressure, visible from the outside of the room, must be provided where steam under pressureis
used.

3. Two applications of streaming steam maintained for aperiod of 1 hour each to be applied
at intervals of not less than 6 hours frer} or more than 24 hours will be accepted as an alternate
for steam under pressure for disinfection of mattress materials or made-up mattresses. When
streaming steam is employed, valved outlets must be provided near the bottom and top of the

room used for this purpose.

--3--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



adtherized-agents:} By application of a chemical pesticide registered with or exempted by the

United States Environmental Protection Agency and registered with the State Department of

Agriculture. The chemical pesticide must:

—-4--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



(&) Have clearly stated on the label, or on printed matter included in each container or
package, detailed instructionsfor its use in disinfecting used or secondhand articles;

(b) Have clearly stated on the label a statement that the pesticide is safe to use on bedding;
and

(c) Beappliedin a manner that ensures that the used or secondhand articlesare
disinfected.

5. By amethod approved by a local health authority in areas where the laws and
regulations governing sterilization of used bedding are administered by local health
authorities.

Sec. 9. NAC 444.259 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444259 1. TheHedlth Division shall charge and collect [$125} $402 for each annual
permit to operate a public bathing or swimming facility or natural bathing place, except in areas
where the laws and regulations governing such facilities and bathing places are administered by
local health authorities.

2. TheHealth Division shall charge and collect [fees} $325 for reviewing plans for fsueh
faeHities-and-bathing places-asteltews} a new public bathing or swimming facility or natural
bathing place, except in areas where the laws and regulations governing fthe} such facilities and

bathing places are administered by local health authorities . |-

--5--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



3. TheHealth Division shall charge and collect $262.50 for reviewing plansfor a
remodeled public bathing or swimming facility or natural bathing place which has a permit,
except in areas where the laws and regulations governing such facilities and bathing places
are administered by local health authorities.

Sec. 10. NAC 444.521 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444521 1. TheHedth Division shal charge and collect [$170-forthe issuanceof} $332
for each annual permit {ferthe-operation-of} to operate a public spa, except in areas where the
laws and regulations governing public spas are administered by local health authorities.

2. TheHealth Division shall charge and collect {fees} $370 for reviewing plans fef} for a

new public fspas-asfeHews:

spa, except in areas where the laws and regulations governing public spas are administered by

local health authorities.

—-B--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



3. TheHealth Division shall charge and collect $285 for reviewing plans for a remodeled
public spa which has a permit, except in areas where the laws and regulations governing
public spas are administered by local health authorities.

Sec. 11. NAC 444.54635 is hereby amended to read as follows:

44454635 1. The Health Division shall charge and collect feesfor an annual fpermitst
permit to operate a facility for sanitation for camping spaces in accordance with the following
schedule, except in areas where the laws and regulations governing such facilities ffor-sanitation

for-camping-spacest are administered by local health authorities:

For apermit to operate a facility having 30 or less camping spaces............... [$145] $166

For apermit to operate a facility having more than 30 camping spaces........... [145} 166

Plus $1.50 for each camping space over 30 . [te-amaximum-of-$1,000.}

2. TheHeadlth Division shall charge and collect the following fees for reviewing plans of
fsueh} facilities for sanitation [} for camping spaces, except in areas where the laws and

regulations governing such facilities are administered by local health authorities:

operate-the-facility-after the remedeling] $1.50 for each camping

space over 30.

--7--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



Sec. 12. NAC 444.5482 is hereby amended to read as follows:
4445482 The Health Division shall charge and collect fees for a permit to operate a
temporary mass gathering in accordance with the following schedule, except in areas where the

laws and regulations governing temporary mass gatherings are administered by local health

authorities:
For a permit to operate atemporary mass gathering with an anticipated Fee per
attendance of: lay
500 t0 1,000 PEISONS......cverrerrerresreeresseeeeeeseessessessessessessesseessessessessessessessenns $500
1,001 t0 5,000 PEISONS.....ccveerrerereerrerereesseransessseeesessseesssesseesssesssesssessssenns 750
5,001 t0 10,000 PEISONS. ...cccuvrererrurrerrerseeesrerseeessesseesssessseessessssesssesssessses 1,000
10,0071 OF MOIE PEISONS .....eeueerreererneesieesreseesseessesresseessessesseessessesseessesnnens 4500} 2,644

Sec. 13. NAC 444.566 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444566 1. For anannual permit to operate alabor camp, the Health Division shall charge
and collect [$306;} $166, plus $1.25 for each five workers above 30 workers in the camp, except
in areas where the laws and regulations governing the sanitation of labor camps are administered
by local health authorities.

2. TheHeadth Division shall charge and collect the following fees for reviewing plans for
labor camps as follows, except in areas where the laws and regulations governing the sanitation

of labor camps are administered by local health authorities:

--8--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



For aplan [of} for anew Camp.........ccoeeeieieiece e [$36} $124

Plus [ai

each five workers above 30 workersin the camp.
For aplan to remodel acamp which hasapermit..........cccocevcvecevieevenceseeneenn, [36} 83
Plus =

operate the camp-after-theremodeling} $1.25 for each five workers

above 30 workersin the camp.

Sec. 14. NAC 444.56816 is hereby amended to read as follows:

44456816 1. The State Board of Health hereby adopts by reference:

4 (a) Theguidelinesfor playground safety set forth in the Handbook for Public
Playground Safety, as those guidelines existed on fthe-effective date-of-thisregulation] July 24,
2002. A copy of the publication may be obtained, free of charge, from the United States
Consumer Product Safety Commission, Office of Information and Public Affairs, Washington

at the Internet

—31 (b) The Recommended Practice on Lighting for Educational Facilities, in the form

most recently published by the Illuminating Engineering Society of North America. A copy of

--O--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



this publication may be obtained from the I lluminating Engineering Society of North America

at the I nternet address https://www.iesna.org/shop/ for the price of $50.

(¢) The [standards-for-mintmum-ptumbingfaciities setforth-tathel Uniform Plumbing Code,
997-edition} in the form most recently published by the I nternational Association of

Plumbing and Mechanical Officials. A copy of fthestandards} this publication may be obtained

from the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials [;-20001-East-‘Walaut

—41 by telephone at (800) 854-2766 or at the I nternet address http://iapmostore.org, for the

price of $93.

(d) The standards of the American National Standards Institute set forth in fthe-American
National-Standard-fort ANSI Z358.1, Emergency Eyewash and Shower Equipment, fANSH
Z358-1,-1998edition:} in the form most recently published by the American National
Standards I nstitute. A copy of the standards may be obtained from I|HS Global Engineering

Documents

80112} by telephone at (877) 413-5184 or at the I nternet address http://store.ihs.com, for the

price of [$48.]} $85.

2. The State Board of Health will review each revision of the publications adopted by

reference pursuant to paragraphs (b) and (c) of subsection 1 to ensureits suitability for this
State. If the Board determines that a revision is not suitable for this State, the Board will hold
a public hearing to review its deter mination within 6 months after the date of publication of
therevision and give notice of that hearing. If, after the hearing, the Board does not revise its

determination, the Board will give notice within 30 days after the hearing that therevision is

--10--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



not suitable for this State. If the Board does not give such notice, the revision becomes part of
the publication adopted by reference.

Sec. 15. NAC 444.5683 is hereby amended to read as follows:

4445683 Artificial sources of light that are permanently fixed in a school must be installed

to provide [at adistance of 30 inches from the floor:

1 lighting at luminance

levels equal to or greater than those prescribed in tables 1 and 2 of the Recommended Practice

on Lighting for Educational Facilities, adopted by reference pursuant to NAC 444.56816.

Sec. 16. NAC 444.750 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444,750 Asusedin NAC 444.750 to 444.8396, inclusive, and sections 2 to 7, inclusive, of
thisregulation, unless the context otherwise requires, the words and terms defined in NAC
444, 7502 to 444.7772, inclusive, and sections 2 to 6, inclusive, of this regulation have the
meanings ascribed to them in those sections.

Sec. 17. NAC 444.7652 is hereby amended to read as follows:

4447652 [Nitratel “ Nitrogen” removal wastewater treatment unit” means a system that

receives sewage and, through biological denitrification, chemical reduction or ion exchange,

reduces the fritrate} nitrogen level of the effluent . fte-tessthan-10-miHigramsper-Hter+measdred
astotal nitrogen.}

Sec. 18. NAC 444.7668 is hereby amended to read as follows:

--11--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



4447668 1. “Primary treatment unit” means a system or receptacle that is designed and
constructed to:

() Receive the discharge of sewage from a building sewer;

(b) Partialy or completely treat the sewage; and

(c) Discharge effluent for final disposal.

2. Thetermincludes, without limitation, a septic tank, an aerobic wastewater treatment unit,
afnitratel nitrogen removal wastewater treatment unit and any other alternative treatment
system.

Sec. 19. NAC 444.775 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444775 1. “Single-family dwelling” means one or more buildings -+aetuding-detached
accessory structures, that are] that:

(a) Aredesigned and used as a home by the occupants of the buildings fard-which-are} ;

(b) Include a bathroom unit and a kitchen unit; and

(c) Areserved by anindividual sewage disposal system.

2. Theterm does not include an accessory structure or a multiple-dwelling structure.

Sec. 20. NAC 444.777 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444777 *“Watercourse” means the bed or channel of awaterway. The term includes, without
limitation, ariver, creek, stream, pond or lake, but does not include an irrigation ditch or
drainage channel . fwhi
snow-}

Sec. 21. NAC 444.7825 is hereby amended to read as follows:

4447825 1. Thefollowing provisions and publications are hereby adopted by reference:

--12--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



-} (a) Standards 40, 41 and 46 of ftheNatienal-SanitatienFeundation} NSF | nternational,
in the form most recently published by NSF International. These standards are available foy
mait] from {the National Sanitation Foundation} NSF International [, 3475 Plymouth Road, Ann
Arbor, Michigan 48105, or} by telephone at (800) [673-6275. The prices are $70 for Standard 40,
S70tor-Standard-41-and-$60-tor-Standard-46:

—2 699-9277, for the price of $95 each.

(b) Standard Specifications for Public Works Construction, 1996-edition;-as-spensered-and

distributed} in the form most recently published by the Regional Transportation Commission of

Washoe County, Washoe County, the City of Sparks, the City of Reno, Carson City and the City

of Yerington. This publication is available Hoy-maH-from-the Regional Franspertation

—3} freeof charge at the I nternet address http: //www.rtcwashoe.com/str eets/orangebook/.

(c) The Uniform Plumbing Code, [1997-edition;-as-adepted} in the form most recently

published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials. This
publication is available foy-mai} from the International Association of Plumbing and
Mechanical Officials
telephone at [{909)-595-8449;] (800) 854-2766, at a price of [$45.45,plus $2.05for-shipping-and
handling:

—41  $93.

(d) The Design Manual for On-site Wastewater Treatment and Disposal Systems, whichis

published by the Environmental Protection Agency (reference document number PB83-219907).

This document is available by mail from the National Technical Information Service, 5285 Port

--13--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



Royal Road, Springfield, Virginia 22161, or by telephone at (800) 553-6847, at a price of
[$81.50,} $97.50, plus $5 for shipping and handling.

2. The State Board of Health will review each revision of the publications adopted by
reference pursuant to paragraphs (a), (b) and (c) of subsection 1 to ensure its suitability for
this State. If the Board determines that a revision is not suitable for this State, the Board will
hold a public hearing to review its determination within 6 months after the date of the
publication of the revision and give notice of that hearing. If, after the hearing, the Board
does not revise its determination, the Board will give notice within 30 days after the hearing
that the revision is not suitable for this State. If the Board does not give such naotice, the
revision becomes part of the publication adopted by reference.

Sec. 22. NAC 444.783 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444,783 [Exeeptas-otherwise provided-inthissection-thel The health authority may grant

an owner of

an individual sewage disposal system fi-the-special-exemption:} approval for an alternate

method of compliance with any provision of this chapter if the alternate method of

compliance:

1. Will not be detrimental to the public health;

2. Isjustified by an engineer {;
—=21 if, because of site conditions or proposed alternative treatments, the health authority
requires the alternate method of compliance to be justified by an engineer;

3. Involves an advance in technology, improvement in materials, or alternative method of

construction or operation ;

thepublic-health:} and

--14--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



3} 4. Doesnot conflict with the provisions of subsection 1 of NAC 444.778 and
paragraphs (a) to (d), inclusive, of subsection 2 of NAC 444.778.

Sec. 23. NAC 444.784 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444,784 1. Approval must be obtained from the administrative authority to construct, alter
or extend an individual sewage disposal system. This approval for new construction is required
before any building permit may be issued for any structure which requires an individual sewage
disposal system.

2. Therequest for approval must include:

(8 The name, address and current phone number of the applicant.

(b) Thelegal description of the property, including the lot and block number, township,
range, section and assessor’ s parcel number, on which construction, alteration or extension is
proposed.

(c) A plot plan.

3. Theplot plan must include:

() Thetitle and date of the plan and the signature of the owner or his representative.

(b) A map of the areain which the individual sewage disposal system will be located that
shows the location of the roads and streets.

(c) Thelocation and distance to well and sewage systems on surrounding lots. If the lots are
vacant, the plot plan must so indicate.

(d) Thedirection of north clearly indicated.

(e) The distance within 500 feet to any watercourse indicated, including, without limitation,
any pond, lagoon or stream. If there are no watercourses, the plot plan must so indicate.

(f) Thelocation of each percolation test hole and boring test hole.

--15--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



(g) Thelocation and depth of each proposed or actual well, including the depth of casing or
surface grout seal.

(h) Each component of the individual sewage disposal system, which must be properly
marked and located at specified distances.

(i) Thedistanceto city sewers. If there are none, the plot plan must so indicate.

(J) Thedistance of each well and soil absorption system to the property line.

(K) The scale to which the plan isdrawn, such as 1 inch = 30 feet, 40 feet, 50 feet, 60 feet,

etc.

(1) The number of bedroomsin the single-family dwelling . fertherequestfor-approvalis

(m) The capacity of the septic tank.

(n) The maximum slope across the absorption system area.

(o) Thedimensions of thelot.

(p) The depth, length, width and spacing of any absorption trenches.

(q) Thelocation of the water supply lines, building sewer lines and other underground
utilities.

(r) Thelocation of the structures, paved areas, driveways, trees and patios.

(s) Thelocation of the source of water to be used by the individual sewage disposal system,
including, without limitation, awell or other source approved by the administrative authority.

(t) Thelocation of the reserve absorption area, which must be of a size not less than the size

of the primary absorption area.

--16--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



4. Soil characteristics, depth to water table and bedrock, percolation test results and design
specifications must accompany the plot plan.

5. A permit issued under NAC 444.750 to 444.8396, inclusive, and sections 2 to 7,
inclusive, of thisregulation is deemed to be atemporary permit to operate an individual sewage
disposal system. The operating permit isvalid until:

(& Theindividual sewage disposa system fails; or

(b) A community sewerage system fis} :

(1) Isinstalled and available to servicethe areaf} ; and
(2) Passesthrough or isin physical contact with the property line or islocated adjacent
to the property in a street or right-of-way that abuts the property line.

6. For the purposes of this section, an individual sewage disposal system shall be deemed to
have failed if:

(8 A condition or malfunction occursin theindividua sewage disposal system, or in the
operation of the system, that threatens the public health by inadequately treating sewage or by
creating apotential for direct or indirect contact between sewage and the public, including, without
limitation:

(1) Sewage onthe ground;

(2) A backup of sawageinto a structure that is caused by the dow soil absorption of effluent;
(3) Sewage leaking from a septic tank, dosing tank, holding tank or collection system; and
(4) Effluent contaminating the groundwater or surface water; or

(b) The operator of the system fails to comply with the requirements of the permit issued to
operate the system.

Sec. 24. NAC 444.786 is hereby amended to read as follows:

--17--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



444,786 1. Except as otherwise provided in this subsection, an application for a permit for
an individual sewage disposal system submitted to the health authority must be denied in writing
and the reasons specified therefor if:

() The health authority determines that the proposed installation will not comply with NAC
444,750 to 444.8396, inclusive |5} , and sections 2 to 7, inclusive, of thisregulation;

(b) fPublic-or} A community sewerage fsystems-arel system is available pwithin-400-feet-of
the-nearest} and passes through or isin physical contact with the property line or islocated
adjacent to the property in a street or right-of-way that abuts the property line; or

(c) The proposed individual sewage disposal system iswithin the service area of a sewer
company which provides sewage services that are subject to the jurisdiction of the Public
Utilities Commission of Nevada or any local governmental entity, including, without limitation,

ageneral improvement district, that has jurisdiction over the sewer servicesin that geographical

area. A permit may be granted by the health authority if the [Public Utiities Compmission-of
9 mental-entity] sewer company approves in writing the construction of the

individual sewage disposal system within its service area or jurisdiction.

2. A person who has reason to believe that an action taken by the health authority pursuant
to NAC 444.750 to 444.8396, inclusive, and sections 2 to 7, inclusive, of thisregulation is
incorrect or based on inadequate knowledge may, within 10 business days after receiving notice
of the action, request an informal discussion with the employee responsible for the action and the
immediate supervisor of the employee.

3. If theinformal discussion does not resolve the problem, the aggrieved person may, within
10 business days after the date scheduled for the informal discussion, submit awritten request to

the Bureau for an informal conference. The informal conference must be scheduled for a date,

--18--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



place and time mutually agreed upon by the aggrieved person and the Bureau, except that the
informal conference must be held no later than 60 days after the date on which the Bureau
received the written request.

4. Except as otherwise provided in subsection 5, the determination of the Bureau resulting
from the informal conference cannot be appealed and is the final remedy available to the
aggrieved person.

5. Anapplicant for or holder of a permit issued pursuant to NAC 444.750 to 444.8396,
inclusive, and sections 2 to 7, inclusive, of thisregulation who is aggrieved by an action of the
health authority relating to the denial of an application for, or the suspension or revocation of,
such a permit may appeal that action in accordance with NAC 439.300 to 439.395, inclusive,
after exhausting the informal procedures set forth in this section, except that the Bureau may
waive the informal procedures, or any portion thereof, by giving written notice to the aggrieved
person.

6. A permitisvoid 12 months after the date of issuance if the proposed construction,
alteration or extension of the individual sewage disposal system is not completed within that
period. Upon the request of the holder of the permit, an extension of the permit may be granted
inincrements of 1 year if the appropriate fees are paid and the proposed plans meet the
requirements of NAC 444.750 to 444.8396, inclusive [} , and sections 2 to 7, inclusive, of this
regulation.

7. Asused in this section, “Bureau” means the Bureau of Health Protection Services of the
Health Division or its successor.

Sec. 25. NAC 444.788 is hereby amended to read as follows:

--19--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



444,788 1. Inspections may be required of the system materials and the trench before the
trench isfilled with aggregate or rock. Inspections by the administrative authority may be
required before the sewer line, septic tank and soil absorption system may be covered.
Inspections of aternative systems are required at intervals specified in NAC 444.750 to
444.8396, inclusive [} , and sections 2 to 7, inclusive, of thisregulation. If an engineer verifies
that an individual sewage disposal system was constructed according to the plans approved by
the administrative authority, the administrative authority may waive its inspection of the system.

2. Until the individual sewage disposal system has passed inspection by the administrative
authority and a permit or other type of approval authorizing feceupaney-of-the-buitding} use of
the system has been issued, there must be no use of the system, no occupancy of the building and
no permanent electrical power connection to the property.

3. Inanareainwhich thereisalocal administrative authority, review of designs and
inspections for residential systems may be performed by city, district or county building
inspectors.

Sec. 26. NAC 444.790 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444,790 1. A minimum areaof 1 acre (43,560 square feet), including public streets and
alleys or other public rights-of-way, lands or any portion thereof abutting on, running through or
within abuilding site, is required for the installation of an individual sewage disposal system on
alot served by awell.

2. For alot that isa part of atentative map that is approved before January 1, 2000, a
minimum area of 1/4 acre (10,890 square feet), including public streets or aleys or other public

rights-of-way, lands or any portions thereof abutting on, running through or within a building

--20--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



site, isrequired for the installation of an individual sewage disposal system on alot served by a
community water supply.

3. For alot that is part of atentative map that is approved on or after January 1, 2000, a
minimum area of 1/2 acre (21,780 square feet), including public streets or aleys or other public
rights-of-way, lands or any portions thereof abutting on, running through or within a building
site, isrequired for the installation of an individual sewage disposal system on alot served by a

community water supply.

Sec. 27. NAC 444.792 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444,792 1. Except as otherwise provided in this section, an individual sewage disposal
system must be located on the same lot as the building or structure that the system serves. The
administrative authority may approve the use of a part of an abutting lot to provide additional
space for an individual sewage disposal system or any part thereof, if the owner of the individual
sewage disposal system can show:

(a) Proper cause, including, without limitation, alegal right of the owner to use the abutting
land as aresult of atransfer of ownership of the abutting lot or an easement to use the abutting
lot; and

(b) Use of the abutting lot for the individual sewage disposal system does not violate any
other requirement of NAC 444.750 to 444.8396, inclusive {} , and sections 2 to 7, inclusive, of

thisregulation.

--21--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



2. The minimum horizontal separations that must be maintained between the perimeter of

the components of an individual sewage disposal system and the following features are:

Minimum horizontal diStanCe, ........cccccecevieevevieenecce e, [Building Septic  Disposa
S tank field
drain} [(shallow)}

Building or structure —1 8 8

Property lines (10 10 10

Water supply wells 509 100’ 100’

(sealed to 50 feet)

Water supply WEIIS (MOt ......cooveeceice s [504 100/ 150"

Public water supply wells =edt 150 150" B}

Streams or watercourses 564 100’ 100’

Drainage channels [257 25 25'

Large trees or shrubs —1 10’ 10

--22--

Adopted Regulation R100-07



Disposal fields 1 5 —

Community water main line [107 10’ 25
Individual water serviceline o9 10’ 25’
Bry-wels — 6" 20"

Sec. 28. NAC 444.798 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444,798 1. An approved cleanout must be installed fhetween-the butding-drain-and} on

the building sewer line. The cleanout must be located within 3 feet of the structure or, if the

cleanout cannot be placed within 3 feet of the structure, as close as practicable to the structure.
At least one additional cleanout must be placed for each 100-foot increment of sewer line and for
each aggregate change in the direction of the sewer linein excess of 90 degrees.

2. The building sewer between the house and the fseptic-tank} individual sewage disposal
system must be approved pipe made of cast-iron, concrete, cement-asbestos or polyvinylchloride,

with watertight joints.

--23--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



3. Except as otherwise provided in this section, the run of the building sewer, when
practical, must be at a uniform slope of not less than 1/4 inch per foot from the building toward
the point of disposal. If approved by the administrative authority, a building sewer whichiis:

(& Not lessthan 4 inches or more than 6 inches in diameter may have a slope of not less than
1/8 inch per foot.

(b) Eight inches or more in diameter may have a slope of not less than 1/16 inch per foot.

4. A building sewer must be laid on undisturbed earth or well-compacted material. The top
of the building sewer must be 12 inches or more below the final grade.

5. Thefollowing isadiagram of an individual sewage disposal system:

BUILDING
FOUNDATION UNTREATED )
BUILDING PAPE-Ht
LEAN OUT CAP GEOTEXTILE
MANHOLES FABRIC OR : ABSORPTION
CLEAN OUT | =a——  TRENCH —_——

A

e

330 U T IR a.*-n

}f i WASTEWATER
BUILDING SEWER TEREATMENT TAKK

Ly ‘ﬁd*&?ﬁa*ﬁbhv qﬁk

\5 'L.-

:w_

END
CAF

A P e ] p Ty r"" n.u."."r

5:
MIN  NDISTURBED
S50IL

UNDISTURBED J
SOIL

GRAVEL

Sec. 29. NAC 444.818 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444818 1. Cesspoolsare prohibited.

2. Thedischarge of surface, rain and other clear water into an individual sewage disposal
system is prohibited.

3. An absorption system that must be specially designed because of the limiting
characteristics of the site must be designed by an engineer in accordance with the design criteria:

(8) That are set forthin NAC 444.8374 to 444.8396, inclusive, if the absorption system isan
alternative absorption system; or

--24--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



(b) That have been approved by the health authority.

4. Anindividual sewage disposal system is prohibited in any area subject to vehicular traffic
or any areato be paved.

5. Sewage or any waste must not be discharged into any well, deep pit or mine shaft, or onto
the ground surface.

6. Approved plans and specifications must not be revised except with written approval of
the administrative authority.

7. If the soil has afast percolation rate, the administrative authority may, depending on the
characteristics of the soil and site, require:

(& The plansfor the system be designed especially for the site; and

(b) The setbacks from wells or watercourses, or both, be increased.

8. Anindividua sewage disposal system must be operated and maintained so as not to

create a public hazard or nuisance, or cause water pollution.

ed} A septic tank that isno
longer in use may be pumped, removed and disposed of. fAr-abandened] A septic tank that is
no longer in use and is to be abandoned in place must be filled with dirt or sand after being
pumped. An excavation site created by the removal of a septic tank must be backfilled with
suitable material that is compatible to the intended future use of the site.

10. To facilitate cleaning and maintenance operations, the installer of an individual sewage
disposal system shall provide the owner with adiagram of the system. The diagram must include
the location of the house, the septic tank, the cleanouts and the absorption system. This

information must be kept on the premises regardless of changes in occupancy.

--25--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



11. Any necessary bendsin the individual sewage disposal system before the system enters
the septic tank must be accomplished by the use of pipe fittings that are 45 degrees or less.

12. Every dwelling or habitation, including occupied trailers, must have an approved
method of sewage disposal. The health authority may issue a permit for the temporary use of a
holding tank at locations, including labor camps for construction or drilling projects, where an
approved method of sewage disposal is not available. An application for a permit for the
temporary use of a holding tank must include a copy of:

(&) A contract between the applicant and a licensed septic tank pumping contractor that
provides for the removal and disposal of wastes from the temporary tank; and

(b) A letter from an approved sewage disposal treatment facility stating that the facility
agrees to accept the wastes from the holding tank collected by the septic tank pumping
contractor.
= A permit for the temporary use of a holding tank issued pursuant to this subsection isvalid for
30 days and may be renewed as necessary.

13. Thedisposal of sewage must be through an approved individual sewage disposal
system.

14. Provisions not covered by NAC 444.750 to 444.8396, inclusive, and sections2to 7,
inclusive, of thisregulation must meet the most restrictive requirements found in the current
publication of the Uniform Plumbing Code [} , adopted by reference pursuant to NAC
444.7825.

15. Disposal fields must be located in unshaded, unobstructed areas.

16. Where a public water supply is unavailable, only one single-family dwelling per acre

served by an individual sewage disposal system is allowed. For the purposes of this subsection,

--26--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



obtaining the approval of the Division of Water Resources of the State Department of
Conservation and Natural Resources to use awell as municipal or quasi-municipal water use

does not constitute a“public water supply.” The administrative authority shall not allow any

additional individual sewage disposal systemsto be installed on the |ot. [A-commercial-system

--27--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



Sec. 30. NAC 444.828 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444.828 The Health Division shall charge and collect feesfor its services in accordance
with the following schedule, except in areas where the laws and regul ations governing individual
sewage disposal systems and septic tank pumping contractors are administered by another
administrative authority:

1. For apermit to construct an individual sewage disposal system for a
single-family dwelling, including areview of the plan for the system and an
initial INSPECtion Of the SYSLEM .......cveeece e, [$200} $498

2. For apermit to construct aresidentia system that utilizes an aternative
treatment or disposal system design, including areview of the plan for the

system and an initial inspection of the SYSLEM........cccvveeiveiereer e, [$250} $498

Haspection-of-the system| review of the plan for a primary treatment unit............ [$250} $498
4. For the resubmission of or revision to a plan described in subsection 1, 2

0] TSRS [$100} $124
5. For areinspection of an individual sewage disposal system...........c.cceeeeen. $100

6. For an inspection of asystem or unit described in subsection 1, 2 or 3
where such inspection is necessary to obtain aloan to purchase a piece of real

(S0 o= 4 Y2 SR $133

--28--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



7. For an annua permit for a septic tank pumping contractor .............ccceeeeenn, [$150} $332
Plus [$50} $322 per year for each pumping unit to be authorized for use

pursuant to the permit.
8. To extend apermit to construct an individual sewage disposal system for

a l-year period after the expiration date of the permit............cccccoevvvieieiiccecciecen, [$56} $332

Sec. 31. NAC 444.8302 is hereby amended to read as follows:

4448302 {1 The plansfor fan

system must be submitted for review to the Division of Environmental Protection of the State

Department of Conservation and Natural Resources.

Sec. 32. NAC 444.8314 is hereby amended to read as follows:

--29.-
Adopted Regulation R100-07



444.8314 1. An aerobic wastewater treatment unit requires routine maintenance. The
owner of an individual sewage disposal system that will include an aerobic wastewater treatment
unit shall include in the design plans submitted to the administrative authority a maintenance
agreement with fal an approved service provider that covers the anticipated life span of the
individual sewage disposal system.

2. The maintenance agreement for the individual sewage disposal system must include,
without limitation, a yearly inspection of the system, and the components thereof, which verifies
that the systemiis:

(&) Functioning correctly; and

(b) Producing effluent which has levels of total suspended solids and biological oxygen
demand that are each 30 milligrams or less per liter.

3. Attherequest of the administrative authority, the owner of an individual sewage
disposal system that includes an aerobic wastewater treatment unit must provide to the
administrative authority written documentation demonstrating that the maintenance required
by subsection 2 has been performed.

4. An aerobic wastewater treatment unit that produces effluent with alevel of total
suspended solids or biological oxygen demand that is more than 30 milligrams per liter must be
repaired or replaced in accordance with this section and NAC 444.8316 and 444.8318 before the
unit may be used.

41 5. If the administrative authority determines that the degradation of groundwater or the
constraints of the site warrant the need for an effluent which is of higher quality than that which
would be provided by a septic tank, the administrative authority may require that the individual

sewage disposal system include an aerobic wastewater treatment unit. If the administrative

--30--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



authority requires the use of an aerobic wastewater treatment unit pursuant to this subsection, the

owner shall not construct or install on that site an individual sewage disposal system that does

not include an aerobic wastewater treatment unit.

--31--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



Sec. 33. NAC 444.8316 is hereby amended to read as follows:

4448316 1. An aerobic wastewater treatment unit must be approved by:

(a) FheNational-SanitationFoundationt NSF International pursuant to its Standard 40;

(b) Any other equivalent nationally recognized testing laboratory approved by the health
authority; or

(c) The health authority.

2. [Fheoewneroff An application to construct an individual sewage disposal system that
includes an aerobic wastewater treatment unit fshat-trctude with-the applicationforreview-of

I b the adrainicteat hority:

—{ayEvidenecel must include evidence that the unit has been approved pursuant to subsection 1
— (b} The procedures used to test the unit.}

3. Anindividual sewage disposal system that uses an aerobic wastewater treatment unit
must be designed by an engineer. The use of an individual sewage disposal system that includes
an aerobic wastewater treatment unit must be consistent with the approved design application

and intended use for such a system.

--32--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



4. An aerobic wastewater treatment unit must conform with all applicable provisions of the
Nevada Administrative Code and is subject to any other requirements for design that are
determined necessary by the administrative authority.

5. Anadministrative authority may authorize areduction in the size of the absorption area if
the administrative authority requires the use of an aerobic wastewater treatment unit pursuant to
subsection {4} 5 of NAC 444.8314. Any reduction in the size of the absorption area must be
justified by an engineer based on the conditions of the soil and constraints of the site. No direct
surface discharge is permitted.

6. Except in those cases where an aerobic wastewater treatment unit is required pursuant to
subsection {4} 5 of NAC 444.8314, an aerobic wastewater treatment unit must not be used where
electrical serviceis unreliable, dependable maintenance is not available, or intermittent use of the
aerobic wastewater treatment unit will adversely effect the functioning of the individual sewage
disposal system.

7. Thedesign plansfor an aerobic wastewater treatment unit must include a schematic
detailing a 24-hour operating alarm system for the aerobic wastewater treatment unit.

8. A manual for the operation and maintenance of an aerobic wastewater treatment unit
must be submitted to the administrative authority with the design plans. The administrative
authority shall not approve an aerobic wastewater treatment unit if an operation and maintenance
manual has not been submitted with the design plans and approved by the administrative
authority.

Sec. 34. NAC 444.8318 is hereby amended to read as follows:

--33--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



444.8318 1. The construction of an aerobic wastewater treatment unit must be inspected
and verified by an engineer .

system-for-his-herme-the-hemeowner} The inspections must be conducted when:

() The absorption trenches have been excavated or, if an elevated mound system isto be

used, when the basal area of the mound has been scarified;

(b) Thedistribution piping has been placed in the aggregate;

(c) The system has been covered with soil; and

(d) All the pumps, switches, alarms, aeration units and other components associated with the
individual sewage disposal system have been installed. The engineer or homeowner, as

appropriate, shall verify that the operational liquid levels are set as specified by the design plans.

uhit-ts-designed-by-an-engineer-thel The engineer shall, within 30 days after the date on which

the construction of the system is completed, submit a letter to the administrative authority stating

that the system was constructed in accordance with the approved plans.

Sec. 35. NAC 444.8321 is hereby amended to read as follows:

--34--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



4448321 1. A [nitrate} nitrogen removal wastewater treatment unit requires routine
maintenance. The owner of an individual sewage disposal system that will include a fritrate}
nitrogen removal wastewater treatment unit shall include in the design plans submitted to the
administrative authority a maintenance agreement with fa} an approved service provider that
covers the anticipated life span of the individual sewage disposal system.

2. The maintenance agreement for the individual sewage disposal system must include,
without limitation, a yearly inspection of the system, and the components thereof, which verifies
that the systemiis:

(&) Functioning correctly; and

(b) Producing effluent {whichhas nitrate levels that are 10 milligrams or less per iter,
moasHrcdastetalpitregor:

—3—A-nitratel with nitrogen level reductions that are consistent with the performance
specifications provided by the manufacturer.

3. Theowner of an individual sewage disposal system that includes a nitrogen removal
wastewater treatment unit shall maintain, for thelife of the system, written documentation
demonstrating that the maintenance required by subsection 2 has been performed at intervals
not to exceed 12 months. At the request of the administrative authority, the owner shall
provide the documentation for review.

4. A nitrogen removal wastewater treatment unit that produces effluent with fatevel-of

nitrogen level
reductions that are not consistent with the performance specifications provided by the

manufacturer must be repaired or replaced in accordance with this section and NAC 444.8322

and 444.8324 . fhetorethe-unit-may-be-used-

--35--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



—41 5. If the administrative authority determines that the degradation of groundwater or the
constraints of the site warrant the need for an effluent which is of higher quality than that which
would be provided by a septic tank, the administrative authority may require that the individual
sewage disposal system include a fritrate} nitrogen removal wastewater treatment unit. If the
administrative authority requires the use of a fritrate} nitrogen removal wastewater treatment
unit pursuant to this subsection, the owner shall not construct or install on that site an individual

sewage disposal system that does not include a fritrate} nitrogen removal wastewater treatment

unit.

--36--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



6. Theapproved service provider shall develop and submit to the health and

administrative authorities a regulatory oversight program for the use of nitrogen removal
wastewater treatment units. The regulatory oversight program must include, without
limitation, the legal description of each lot to be included in the program, the type and
frequency of maintenance to be conducted, requirementsfor reporting maintenance that is
conducted and provisions for addressing noncompliance with the provisions of this chapter by
occupants of a building served by a nitrogen removal wastewater treatment unit. Until both the
health and administrative authorities approve the regulatory oversight program in writing, the
administrative authority shall not approve nitrogen removal wastewater treatment units for
use.

Sec. 36. NAC 444.8322 is hereby amended to read as follows:

4448322 1. A fnitrate} nitrogen removal wastewater treatment unit must be approved by:

(8) [FheNational-SanitationFeundation} NSF International pursuant to its Standard 40;

--37--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



(b) Any other equivalent nationally recognized testing laboratory approved by the health
authority; or
(c) The health authority.

2. [Fheownerof} An application to construct an individual sewage disposal system that

includes a fritratel nitrogen removal wastewater treatment unit fshat-tactude with-the

—fa)-Evideneel must include evidence that the unit has been approved pursuant to subsection 1
——{(b) The procedures used to test the unit.}

3. Anindividual sewage disposal system that uses a nitrogen removal wastewater
treatment unit must be designed by an engineer. The use of an individual sewage disposal
system that includes a fritrate} nitrogen removal wastewater treatment unit must be consistent
with the approved design application and intended use for such a system.

4. A fnitrate} nitrogen removal wastewater treatment unit must conform with all applicable
provisions of the Nevada Administrative Code and is subject to any other requirements for
design that are determined necessary by the administrative authority.

5. Anadministrative authority may authorize areduction in the size of the absorption area if
the administrative authority requires the use of afritrate} nitrogen removal wastewater treatment
unit pursuant to subsection {4} 5 of NAC 444.8321. Any reduction in the size of the absorption
areamust be justified by an engineer based on the conditions of the soil and constraints of the

site. No direct surface discharge is permitted.

--38--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



6. Except in those cases where a fritrate} nitrogen removal wastewater treatment unit is
required pursuant to subsection {4} 5 of NAC 444.8321, afritrate} nitrogen removal wastewater
treatment unit must not be used where :

(&) Theunit requireselectrical power and the electrical service is unreliable [-dependable:}

(b) Dependable maintenance is not available f-ef} ; or

(c) Thebuilding will be occupied on a part-time basis and intermittent use of the fritrate}
nitrogen removal wastewater treatment unit will adversely effect the functioning of the
individual sewage disposal system.

7. Thedesign plansfor afritrate} nitrogen removal wastewater treatment unit must include
a schematic detailing a 24-hour operating alarm system for the fritrate} nitrogen removal
wastewater treatment unit.

8. A manual for the operation and maintenance of a faitrate} nitrogen removal wastewater
treatment unit must be submitted to the administrative authority with the design plans. The
administrative authority shall not approve a fritrate} nitrogen removal wastewater treatment unit
if an operation and maintenance manual has not been submitted with the design plans and
approved by the administrative authority.

Sec. 37. NAC 444.8324 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444.8324 1. The construction of a fritrate} nitrogen removal wastewater treatment unit

must be inspected and verified by an engineer . fer-+-the unitisdesigned-by-a-homeowneras

1 The inspections must be conducted

--30--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



() The absorption trenches have been excavated or, if an elevated mound system isto be
used, when the basal area of the mound has been scarified;

(b) Thedistribution piping has been placed in the aggregate;

(c) The system has been covered with soil; and

(d) All the pumps, switches, alarms, aeration units and other components associated with the
individual sewage disposal system have been installed. The engineer or homeowner, as

appropriate, shall verify that the operational liquid levels are set as specified by the design plans.

treatment-unitis-designed-by-an-engineer-thel The engineer shall, within 30 days after the date

on which the construction of the system is completed, submit aletter to the administrative

authority stating that the system was constructed in accordance with the approved plans.

Sec. 38. NAC 444.8356 is hereby amended to read as follows:

4448356 1. |If aresidential system that is designed by a homeowner includes absorption
trenches:

(8 The homeowner shall contact the administrative authority for an inspection before

covering the system; and

--40--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



(b) The administrative authority shall inspect the construction of the system [} by conducting
an on-site inspection or, at the discretion of the administrative authority, reviewing
photographic documentation provided by the homeowner,
= before the covering is placed on the system, to ensure that the system complies with the
approved plans.

2. If anindividual sewage disposal system that includes absorption trenches is designed by
an engineer, the engineer shall, within 30 days after the date on which the construction of the
system is completed, submit aletter to the administrative authority stating that the system was
constructed in accordance with the approved plans.

Sec. 39. NAC 444.8362 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444.8362 1. The construction of an individual sewage disposal system that includes an
absorption bed must be inspected and verified by an engineer or, if the system is designed by a
homeowner as part of aresidential system for his home, the homeowner. The inspections must
be conducted as follows:

() Following excavation, the bottom of the absorption bed must be examined to ensure that
there is no loose soil and that no smearing conditions exist; and

(b) Upon completion of the installation of the distribution lines in the absorption bed, the
individual sewage disposal system must be inspected to ensure that the system complies with the
approved design plans.

2. If aresidential system that includes an absorption bed is designed by a homeowner:

(8 The homeowner shall contact the administrative authority for an inspection; and

--4]--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



(b) The administrative authority shall inspect the construction 5} by conducting an on-site
inspection or, at the discretion of the administrative authority, reviewing photographic
documentation provided by the homeowner,
= before the covering is placed on the system, to ensure that the system complies with the
approved plans.

3. If anindividual sewage disposal system is designed by an engineer, the engineer shall,
within 30 days after the date on which construction of the system is completed, submit aletter to
the administrative authority stating that the system was constructed in accordance with the
approved plans.

Sec. 40. NAC 444.8366 is hereby amended to read as follows:

4448366 1. The health authority shall provide a sizing chart for each chamber system
which it approves. The sizing chart must list the number of chamber units required for a specific
size of septic tank and percolation rate.

2. The percolation rate of the soil on which a chamber system is placed must not be slower
than 60 minutes per inch.

3. Theinvert of the drain piping entering the first chamber of the system must fbe-ret-tess
than-12-threhes-er} not be more than 48 inches below the finished grade. The trench depth for a
chamber system must not be more than 5 feet below the finished grade. The top of the chamber
system must be at least 6 inches below the natural soil surface, and a capping fill must be placed
over the top of the chamber system to allow for settling.

4. The absorption trenches for a chamber system must not be longer than 110 feet.

5. Excavations for absorption trenches for a chamber system must be spaced so that there is

at least 6 feet between the trenches, as measured from the centerline of the trenches.

--42--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



6. The bottom of the excavation for an absorption trench to be used in a chamber system
must be level. The owner must take such precautions as are necessary to avoid compacting the
bottom of the trench. Loose or smeared soil must be raked and removed. No vehicles may travel
on the area of an absorption trench after the excavation of the trench.

7. Dosing isrequired if more than 500 linear feet of absorption trench are required.

8. If achamber system isused in conjunction with an absorption bed rather than an
absorption trench, the chamber system and the absorption bed must comply with the
requirements relating to the sizing for absorption beds set forth in NAC 444.8358 and 444.8361.
The sizing chart provided by the health authority pursuant to this section must not be used to size
an absorption bed in which a chamber system will be placed.

Sec. 41. NAC 444.8368 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444.8368 1. The construction of an individual sewage disposal system that uses a chamber
system must be inspected and verified by an engineer or, if the unit is designed by a homeowner
as part of aresidential system for his home, the homeowner. The inspections must be conducted
asfollows:

(a) Following excavation, the bottom of each absorption trench or the bottom of the
absorption bed, as appropriate, must be inspected to ensure that there is no loose soil and that no
smearing conditions exist; and

(b) Upon completion of the installation of the chambers in the absorption trenches or
absorption bed, the individual sewage disposal system must be inspected to ensure that the
chamber system and the trenches or bed, as appropriate, have been constructed and installed in
accordance with the design plans.

2. If aresidential system that includes a chamber system is designed by a homeowner:

--43--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



(& The homeowner shall contact the administrative authority for an inspection; and

(b) The administrative authority shall inspect the construction of the residential system [} by
conducting an on-site inspection or, at the discretion of the administrative authority, reviewing
photographic documentation provided by the homeowner,
= before the covering is placed on the system, to ensure that the system complies with the
approved plans.

3. If anindividua sewage disposal system is designed by an engineer, the engineer shall,
within 30 days after the date on which the construction of the individual sewage disposal system
is completed, submit a letter to the administrative authority stating the system was constructed in
accordance with the approved plans.

Sec. 42. NAC 444.839 is hereby amended to read as follows:

444839 1. Anelevated mound system must not be constructed on aslopethat is:

(a) Greater than 6 percent, if the soils comprising the slope have percolation rates that are
slower than 60 minutes per inch; or

(b) Greater than 12 percent, if the soils comprising the slope have percolation rates that are
equal to or faster than 60 minutes per inch.

2. Atleast 4 feet of unsaturated soil or fill material, or any combination thereof, must be
maintained between the top of the seasonal high groundwater table or any impervious barrier
such as bedrock. On sloping sites, the depth of unsaturated soil and fill material must be
increased to maintain alevel bed.

3. Percolation tests must be conducted at the depth anticipated by the engineer as being the

point of interface of the native soil and sand fill, and at a depth of 20 inches below the surface of

--44--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



the native soil. The size of the required basal area of the elevated mound system must be based
on the slowest percolation rate.

4. Thefill material for the elevated mound system must meet the following criteria:

Sieve Size Percent by Weight Passing
Sieve

3/8inch 100

No. 4 95-100

No. 8 80-100

No. 16 45-85

No. 30 15-60

No. 50 3-15

No. 100 0-4

5. Whenever practical, the bed for an elevated mound system must be a rectangular bed with

along axisthat is parallel to the contour of the slope to minimize the possibility of seepage from

--45--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



the base of the elevated mound. fH-the-hatural-soi-has-a-percolationrate that-+s-slower-than-60

aspractieak} The minimum area of the bed must be based on an estimated flow of 150 gallons
per day per bedroom and a design application rate of 1.2 gallons per day per square foot. The
bed must be filled with at least 9 inches of clean, graded aggregate that ranges in size from 3/4 to
2 1/2 inches.

6. Thebasal area of an elevated mound system must be sufficiently large enough to absorb
the wastewater before it reaches the perimeter of the elevated mound to avoid the surfacing of

the effluent. The [

mednd-system-arel minimum basal area must be based on the minimum capacity for a septic

tank required by NAC 444.8306 and a design infiltration rate as follows:

Percolation Rate (minutes per Infiltration Rate (gallons fper
inch) day} per square foot)

0-30 12

31-45 75

46-60 20

61-120 25

7. If the site on which an elevated mound system will be located is:
(@) Hat, the entire basal area, calculated as length multiplied by width, must be used to

determine the area needed for the elevated mound system.

--46--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



(b) Sloping, only the area below and down slope from the absorption bed, calculated as W x

(A +1), must be used to determine the area needed for the elevated mound system, where:

(1) “W” equalsthe width of the absorption bed;

(2) “A” equalsthe length of the absorption bed; and

(3) “I” equalsthe required side slope of the elevated mound system as measured from the
edge of the absorption bed to the perimeter of the mound in accordance with subsection 8.

8. The side slopes of the elevated mound system must extend in a horizontal to vertical ratio
that is at least 3to 1. The entire absorption bed must be covered with at least 1 foot of topsoil.
The topsoil cap, which must be placed at the center of the mound, must maintain a minimum
slope of 2 percent away from the crown. Untreated building paper, straw, geotextile fabric, or
any similar covering approved by the health authority, must be placed over the aggregate in the
absorption bed before the topsoil is placed.

9. At least one observation standpipe which extends down to the fill sand must be installed
in the absorption bed.

10. Thefollowingisadiagram of an elevated mound:

Straw or Marsh Hay Perforated o rill or
Medium Sand Fill “"* T;psmt

Topsoil

......

rEI:J

bsoil — — Plowed Surface “%-2% in. Rock

{A) Cross Section

--47--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



' Y
! ! A J
o o o
T —
Distribution I ,I
Laterals !
i ¥
| i
4 z r £
| 'F g w
1
Bed of | !
WT-2:" Rock ! i
i !
| 1
] ! 1
Slopa K
— * o
{(B) Plan View

Sec. 43. NAC 444.7602, 444.8308, 444.831 and 444.8312 are hereby repeal ed.

TEXT OF REPEALED SECTIONS

4447602 “Dry well” defined. (NRS 439.200, 444.650) “Dry well” means a covered

excavation in the ground which receives the discharge of clear rainwater, surface water or

groundwater collected in afooting or drain.

444.8308 Capacity of septic tank serving multiple-dwelling structure. (NRS 439.200,

444.650)

--48--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



1. The minimum capacity of aseptic tank that is used to serve a multiple-dwelling structure
must be calculated based on the number of unitsin the structure, in accordance with the

following table:

Number of Units Within the | Minimum Septic Tank
Multiple-Dwelling Structure | Capacity (in Gallons)
2 1,200

3 1,500

4 2,000

5 2,250

6 2,500

7 2,750

8 3,000

9 3,250

10 3,500

2. If there are more than 10 units in a multiple-dwelling structure, 250 gallons for each such
additional unit must be added to the minimum capacity determined pursuant to subsection 1.

3. For the purposes of determining the minimum capacity of a septic tank pursuant to
subsection 1, each unit in a multiple-dwelling structure shall be deemed to contain only one
bedroom. If any unit in the multiple-dwelling structure contains more than one bedroom, 150
gallons for each such additional bedroom must be added to the minimum capacity determined
pursuant to subsection 1.

--49--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



444,831 Capacity of septic tank serving hotel or motel. (NRS 439.200, 444.650)

1. The minimum capacity of a septic tank that is used to serve a hotel or motel must be
calculated based on the estimated flow of sewage from the hotel or motel, which shall be deemed
to be 60 gallons per day for each bed within the hotel or motel that is a double bed or larger in
size. If the total estimated flow of sewage from the hotel or motel:

(a) 1s1,500 gallons or less per day, the minimum capacity of the septic tank is equal to the
total estimated flow times 1.5.

(b) s more than 1,500 gallons per day, the minimum capacity of the septic tank is equal to
the total estimated flow times 0.75, plus 1,125 gallons.

2. For the purposes of this section, two twin beds shall be deemed to be equivalent in size to
one double bed.

4448312 Capacity of septic tank serving certain commercial structures. (NRS 439.200,
444.650)

1. Theminimum capacity of a septic tank that is used to serve acommercia structure which
is not otherwise covered by NAC 444.8308 or 444.831 must be:

(a) Calculated based on the estimated flow of sewage from the commercial structure, in
accordance with the table set forth in subsection 2; and

(b) Calculated based on the number of fixture unitsin the commercial structure that will be
served by the septic tank, in accordance with the table set forth in subsection 3.
= The calculation that produces the greater septic tank capacity must be used to design the
individual sewage disposal system for the commercial structure.

2. Todetermine the estimated flow of sewage from the commercial structure pursuant to

paragraph (a) of subsection 1.

--50--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



(8) Examine the following table and determine the occupancy or occupancies that most

closely correlate to the intended occupancy of the commercial structure.

TYPE OF OCCUPANCY ESTIMATED FLOW OF SEWAGE
(GALLONSPER DAY)
Airports 15 per employee and 5 per customer
Automobile washes 5 per passenger vehicle
Bowling alleys 75 per lane
Camps:
Campground with central comfort station 35 per person
With flush toilets, no showers 25 per person
Day camps (no meals served) 15 per person
Summer and seasonal 50 per person
Churches:
Sanctuary only 5 per seat
With kitchen facilities 7 per seat
Dance halls 5 per person
Factories:
With showers 35 per employee
Without showers 25 per employee
With cafeteriafacilities Add 5 per employee
Hospitals: 250 per bed
51

Adopted Regulation R100-07



TYPE OF OCCUPANCY ESTIMATED FLOW OF SEWAGE
(GALLONS PER DAY)
With kitchen facilities Add 25 per bed
With laundry facilities Add 40 per bed
Institutions (Residential):
Generd 75 per person
Nursing homes 125 per person
Rest homes 125 per person
Laundries:

Self-service (open a minimum of 10 hours 50 per wash cycle

per day)

Commercial

Per manufacturer’ s specifications

Mobile home parks

250 per space

Offices 20 per employee
Picnic parks (with toilets only) 20 per parking space
Recreational vehicles:
With water hookups 100 per space
Without water hookups 75 per space

Restaurants and cafeterias:

20 per employee

With toilets

Add 7 per customer

With cocktail lounge

Add 2 per meal served

With garbage disposal

Add 1 per meal served

--52--
Adopted Regulation R100-07




TYPE OF OCCUPANCY

(GALLONSPER DAY)

With kitchen waste

Add 6 per meal served

With kitchen waste, disposable service

Add 2 per meal served

Schools:
Teaching staff and other employees 20 per person
Kindergarten or elementary school 15 per pupil
Junior high school, middle school or high 20 per pupil
school
With gym and showers Add 5 per pupil
With cafeteria Add 3 per pupil
Boarding school (including all waste) 100 per person
Service stations:
With toilets 1,000 for first bay
Each additional bay Add 500
Stores:
Staff 20 per employee

With public restroom

1 per 10 square feet of floor space

Swimming pools (public) 10 per person
Theaters and auditoriums:
Indoor 5 per seat
Drive-in 10 per space

--53--

Adopted Regulation R100-07

ESTIMATED FLOW OF SEWAGE




(b) If the estimated flow of sewage for the intended occupancy is 1,500 gallons or less per
day, the minimum required capacity of the septic tank is equal to the estimated flow times 1.5.

(o) If the estimated flow of sewage for the intended occupancy is more than 1,500 gallons per
day, the minimum required capacity of the septic tank is equal to the estimated flow times 0.75,
plus 1,125 gallons.

3. To determine the number of fixture unitsin the commercial structure that will be served
by the septic tank pursuant to paragraph (b) of subsection 1:

(8) Examinethe following table and, for each type of fixture to be served by the septic tank,
determine the number of such fixtures to be used and multiply that number by its corresponding

number of fixture units;

TYPE OF FIXTURE FIXTURE UNITS
Bathtub 2
Bidet 2
Dental unit or cuspidor 1
Drinking fountain 1
Floor drain 2
Interceptor:

For items such as grease, oil or solids 3

For items such as sand or waste from automobile washes | 6
Laundry tub 2
Machine for washing clothes 2
Receptor:

54--

Adopted Regulation R100-07



TYPE OF FIXTURE

FIXTURE UNITS

Indirect waste receptor for items such as refrigerators, 1
coffee urns or water stations

Indirect waste receptor for items such as commercial sinks, | 3
dishwashers or air washers
Shower, single stall 2
Sink:

Bar, private (1 /2 in or 38.1 mm minimum waste) 1

Bar, commercia (2 in or 50.8 mm minimum waste) 2

Commercial, industria or school, including dishwashers, 3
wash-up sinks, and wash-up fountains (2 in or 50.8 mm
minimum waste)

Flushing rim, clinic 6

Residential, with or without dishwasher (2inor 50.8 mm | 2
minimum waste)

Service 3
Mobile home park trap (one for each trailer) 6
Urinal, pedestal, trap arm only 6
Urinal, stall, separate trap 2
Urinals, wall mounted (2 in or 50.8 mm minimum waste), 2
washout, separate trap
Urinal, wall mounted, washdown or siphon jet, integral trap, | 2

trap arm only

--55--
Adopted Regulation R100-07




TYPE OF FIXTURE FIXTURE UNITS

Urinal, wall mounted, blowout, integral trap, trap arm only 6

Washbasin (lavatory) single 1
Washbasin, in sets 2
Water closet, public installation, trap arm only 6

(b) Add together the numbers calculated pursuant to paragraph (a) for each type of fixture.
The sum represents the maximum number of fixture units that will be served by the septic tank.
Based on that number, determine the minimum required capacity of the septic tank pursuant to

the following table:

MAXIMUM NUMBER OF | SEPTIC TANK CAPACITY
FIXTURE UNITSSERVED | (GALLONYS)
20 1,000

25 1,200

33 1,500

45 2,000

55 2,250

60 2,500

70 2,750

80 3,000

90 3,250

--56--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



MAXIMUM NUMBER OF | SEPTIC TANK CAPACITY

FIXTURE UNITSSERVED | (GALLONYS)

100 3,500

(c) If there are more than 100 fixture units, 25 gallons must be added to the minimum

required capacity of the septic tank for each such additional fixture unit.

--57--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



NOTICE OF ADOPTION OF PROPOSED REGULATION
L CB File No. R100-07

The State Board of Health adopted regulations assigned LCB File No. R100-07 which pertain to
chapters 444 of the Nevada Administrative Code.

INFORMATIONAL STATEMENT

1. A description of how public comment was solicited, a summary of public response,
and an explanation how other interested persons may obtain a copy of the
summary.

How public comment was solicited

Pursuant to NRS 233B.0608 (2)(a), BHPS has consulted with owners and officers of all
small businesses that are likely to be affected by the proposed regulation via informal
meetings, telephone and written correspondence.

Comment was solicited from the regulated community, in that each permitted operator,
installer and designer regulated by Nevada Administration Code (NAC) 444 “ Sanitation”
was sent a copy of the small business impact questionnaire and instructions how to view
the proposed regulations on August 6, 2007. Notice of the proposed changes were sent to
all Bureau offices, main county libraries and facilities on the Health Division listing for
posting of proposed regulations. All the above were notified by direct mailing of
scheduled workshops. Notice of proposed workshop was published on August 6, 2007 in
the Reno Gazette-Journal, Las Vegas Review-Journal, Nevada Appea and the Elko Daily
Free Press. The public workshop was held a 9:30 am. on August 21, 2007, by
videoconference between Bureau of Licensure and Certification, 1550 East College
Parkway, Suite 158, Carson City, Nevada, Bureau of Licensure and Certification, 4220
South Maryland Parkway, Suite 810, Las Vegas, Nevada, and Great Basin College,
Griswold Hall, 701 Walnut Street, Elko, Nevada.

Summary of response
One telephone call was received relating to NAC 444,
Nineteen (19) Small Business Impact Questionnaires (SB1Q) were received.

Six (6) workshop attendees testified. Two (2) submitted written statements at the
workshop.

How interested parties may obtain a copy of the summary
A summary of the response can be obtained by contacting:

Joe Pollock
Public Health Engineer

--58--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



Environmental Health Section
Bureau of Health Protection Services
4150 Technology Way, Suite 300
Carson City, Nevada 89706
Telephone: 775-687-7537

Fax: 775-687-7552

The number of personswho:
a. Attended thehearing: 4
b. Testified at the hearing: 3
c. Submitted to the agency written statements. 0

The estimated economic effect of the proposed regulation on the small business
which it is to regulate including, without limitation both adverse and beneficial
effectsand both direct and indirect effects.

@ Estimated economic effect:
@ Regulated businesses:
Based on the comments from the majority of the questionnaires and the
workshop, the proposed changes will not have an adverse economic effect.
2 Public:
Based on the comments from the majority of the questionnaires and
workshop, the proposed changes will not have an adverse economic effect.
(b) Immediate and long term effects:
Q) Regulated businesses:
Based on the comments from the majority of the questionnaires and
workshop, the proposed changes will not have an adverse economic effect.
2 Public:
Based on the comments from the mgority of the questionnaires and
workshop, the proposed changes will not have an adverse economic effect.

A description of the methods that BHPS considered to reduce the impact of the
proposed regulation on small businesses and statement regarding whether the
agency actually used those methods.

In considering methods to reduce the impact of the proposed regulation on small
businesses as required by NRS 233B.0608 (2) (b) (1), the agency shall consider
simplifying the proposed regulation.

No new regulations were added. The fees were only increased to cover the cost of
operating the program.

In considering methods to reduce the impact of the proposed regulation on small
businesses as required by NRS 233B.0608 2 (b) (2), the agency shal consider
establishing different standards of compliance for a small business.

--50--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



Several fee categories were less for smaller businesses including facilities for sanitation
for camping spaces, labor camps and mass gatherings. The larger the facility, the higher
the fee.

In considering methods to reduce the impact of the proposed regulation on small
businesses as required by NRS 233B.0608(2) (b) (3), the agency shall consider modifying
a fee or fine set forth in the regulation so that a small business is authorized to pay a
lower fee or fine.

There are no fines included in the proposed changes to NAC 444. Fees established are
less than many surrounding states and counties in Nevada.

If the regulation was adopted with changes to any part of the proposed regulation,
explain thereasons for making the changesto the regulations as proposed.

The proposed changes to NAC 444.002(4)c will now read: be applied in such a manner
asto ensure that disinfection is achieved.

The proposed changes to NAC 444.784(5)b will now read: A community sewerage
system is installed to service the area, is available and passes through or is in physical
contact with the property line or is located adjacent to the property in a street or right of
way that abuts upon the property line.

The proposed changes to NAC 444.786(1)b will now read: A community sewerage
system is available and passes through or is in physical contact with the property line or
is located adjacent to the property in a street or right of way that abuts upon the property
line: or

The estimated cost to the agency for enforcement of the proposed regulation.

The estimated cost to the agency for implementing the enforcement of the proposed
regulationsis minimal.

A description of any regulations of other state or government agencies which the
proposed regulation overlaps or duplicates and a statement explaining why the
duplication or overlapping is necessary. If the regulation overlaps or duplicates a
federal regulation, name the federal agency.

No overlap or duplication.

If the regulation includes provisions which are more stringent than a federal
regulation which regulates the same activity, a summary of such provisions.

No federa regulation regulates the same activities in Nevada as those regulated under
NAC 444.

--60--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



Total amount BHPS expects to collect from any fees and the manner in which the
money will be used.

BHPS expects to collect additional fee revenue of approximately $246,485 per year from
the increased fees. It is planned that this money will fund the inspection and enforcement
of the sanitation program which includes ensuring establishments are inspected at the
frequencies established in the Nevada Revised Statutes (NRS).

--61--
Adopted Regulation R100-07



