Chapters 702, 703 and 704 of NAC

ADOPTED TEMPORARY REGULATION OF THE
PUBLIC UTILITIES COMMISSION OF NEVADA

LCB File No. T008-14

(Filed with the Secretary of State on March 19, 2015)

Docket No. 12-02013

EXPLANATION - Matter in italics is new; matter in brackets fomitted-material} is material to be omitted.

AUTHORITY: NRS 233B.040, 703.025, 704.210, 704.215, 704.220, 704.250, 704.260 and
704.280.

A REGULATION relating to updating the existing Internet address of the Public Utilities
Commission of Nevada; revising provisions governing certain administrative proceedings and
practice before the Public Utilities Commission of Nevada, including publication of public
notices; updating annual report filing provisions for providers of last resort of basic
telecommunication services; and amending certain provisions adopting publications by
reference.

Section 1. NAC 702.430 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1. A copy of any form that is required to be used pursuant to NAC 702.150 to 702.450,
inclusive, may be:

(a) Obtained at the Internet website of the Commission fathttp:-wiww-puestatenv-us};

(b) Obtained at an office of the Commission; or

(c) Obtained from the Commission by a written request sent to the principal office of the
Commission in Carson City, Nevada, by United States mail or other messenger or delivery
service.

2. The available forms include:

(a) UEC report;

(b) Retail customer report;

1--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



(c) Prepayment report;

(d) Request for refund; and

(e) Request for exemption.

Sec. 2. Chapter 703 of NAC is hereby amended by adding thereto the provision set forth
below:

“Contested case” has the meaning ascribed to it in NRS 233B.032.

Sec. 3. NAC 703.019 is hereby amended to read as follows:

“Commenter” means a person who participates in a {preceeding} contested case as a
commenter pursuant to NAC 703.491.

Sec. 4. NAC 703.491 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Commenters: Conditions and scope of participation in {preceedings} contested cases.

1. A person who is not a party to afpreceeding} conmtested case may participate in the

fproceeding} contested case as a commenter if |+

in-it-as-an-intervener-but} the person desires to file written comments concerning issues in the

fproceeding} contested case.

2. To participate in the {proceeding} contested case as a commenter, the person must file
pwith the Commission a notice of intent to participate as a commenter| written comments prior
to the scheduled hearing on the contested case and identify the person as a “commenter” in all
written comments filed. 1f the person files such fnetice} written comments prior to the

scheduled hearing, the Commission will place the {persen} commenter on the docket-specific

_D--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



service list maintained by the Commission, and the {persen} commenter will receive Hromthe

Commission—eopies} notifications of Commission-issued {pleadings—in-theproceeding} notices

and orders thereafter.

comments will be made part of the record of the {preceeding} contested case, but the written

comments will not be treated as evidence.

51 4. A commenter is not a party of record to the {proceeding} contested case, and a
commenter shall not take any action that only a party of record may take, including, without
limitation, presenting or cross-examining witnesses, conducting discovery, filing a petition for
reconsideration or rehearing or seeking judicial review of a decision of the Commission.

f61 5. If, during the pendency of the {preceeding} contested case, a commenter claims to have
a direct and substantial interest in the proceeding and desires to participate in the proceeding as
an intervener, the commenter may file a petition for leave to intervene with the Commission
pursuant to NAC 703.578 to 703.600, inclusive. If the petition for leave to intervene is filed with
the Commission after the applicable period set forth in NAC 703.590, the petition must state a
substantial reason for the delay as required by that section.

Sec. 5. NAC 703.500 is hereby amended to read as follows:

-3--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



Except as otherwise provided by specific regulationf;—n—any—proceeding—before—the
Ceeebeeea

1. In any proceeding before the Commission, tE}each party of record is entitled to enter an
appearance, introduce relevant evidence, examine and cross-examine witnesses, make
arguments, make and argue motions and generally participate in the proceeding.

2. In any contested case, PEleach commenter is entitled to file written comments with the
Commission pursuant to NAC 703.491.

Sec. 6. NAC 703.160 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1. The Secretary shall cause public notice of each filing or proceeding described in
subsection H6} 9 to be published in the manner prescribed in this section. For a notice that
requires publication in a newspaper pursuant to subsection 5, the {Fhe} publisher of the public
notice shall, not later than 5 days after publication of the notice, provide to the Commission
proof of the publication of the notice. The proof must include:

(a) The name of the newspaper in which the notice was published;

(b) The name of the county in which the notice was published;

(c) A statement signed by the publisher that the newspaper in which the notice was published
is a newspaper of general circulation in the county in which the notice was published; and

(d) The date of the publication of the notice.

2. Except as otherwise provided in this section, if the Secretary, upon determining that a
filing or proceeding is required to be published in a newspaper pursuant to subsection 5,

determines that the filing or proceeding will have:

4
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



(a) A statewide effect, the Secretary shall cause the public notice to be published once in four
or more newspapers of general circulation in this State, no two of which are published in the
same county{Hs

(b) An effect on a limited number of counties, the Secretary shall cause the public notice to
be published once in a newspaper of general circulation in each county affected. If there is no
newspaper published in an affected county, the Secretary shall cause the public notice to be
published once in a newspaper of general circulation in an adjoining county.

3. The Secretary will post each business day on fthe-Internet-website-ef} the Commission’s
website a current list of all public notices published pursuant to this section.

4. {TthetA newspaper public notice must be an advertisement which is not less than 1
column inch by 3 inches, with a border on all sides.f;and-} Any public notice must include, as
appropriate:

(a) At the beginning of the notice, a title that generally describes the relief requested or the
type of proceeding scheduled;

(b) The name of the applicant, complainant or petitioner or the name of the agent for the
applicant, complainant or petitioner;

(c) A brief description of the purpose of the filing or proceeding, including, without
limitation, a clear and concise introductory statement that summarizes the relief requested or the
type of proceeding scheduled fand-the-effeet-of the relieforproceedingupon-consumers};

(d) The location where the filing is on file for the public or the location and time for the
proceeding; and

(e) The date by which persons must file written commentsf;rotices-ofintent-to-participate-as

a-commenter} or petitions for leave to intervene with the Commission.

—5--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



= The public notice must be published prominently so that it is reasonably calculated to
notify affected persons.

5. [If the notice is:

(a) A public notice for a hearing, a workshop or a prehearing conference, the Secretary
shall cause the notice fefhearing} to be:

(1) {Served-on1Distributed to each party and published on the Commission’s website at
least 10 days before the thearing} proceeding is held, 15 days if the proceeding is an NRS
233B.061 rulemaking workshop; tand}

(2) Posted at the principal office of the Commission at least 3 days before the thearing}
proceeding is held; and

(3) Published in the appropriate newspapers at least 10 days before the proceeding if
the matter is a hearing on a proposed regulation.

(b) For a filing or a {preceeding-otherthana hearing} consumer session, the Secretary shall
cause the notice to be published in the appropriate newspapers not less than 3 working days
before the proposal in the filing becomes effective or the {proceeding} consumer session is held.

6. The applicant, complainant or petitioner shall timely pay the cost of the newspaper
publication. If the applicant, complainant or petitioner fails to timely pay the cost of the
publication, the Commission may, after notice and an opportunity to be heard and upon due
consideration of all relevant circumstances, dismiss the applicable filing without prejudice, seek
an administrative fine pursuant to NRS 703.380, or both dismiss the applicable filing without
prejudice and seek an administrative fine.

7. On a weekly basis, the Commission will {eause-to-be-published} post on its website a

summary of public notices concerning the filings and proceedings described in subsection H60} 9.

-—6--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



seetton;t The Secretary’s notice shall be deemed fte-be} legally sufficient {publie} notice of the

filing or proceeding, even if the public notice Hinthe} summary fefpublienotices} is deficient or

fails to be {published} posted pursuant to this section.

HO—Except as otherwise provided pursuant to subsection H2} 11, the provisions of this

section apply to the following filings or proceedings:

(a) An application or tariff filing involving any authorization, expansion, reduction or
curtailment of services, facilities or authority, any increase in rates, fares or charges, or any
change in regulations.

(b) A complaint filed with the Commission pursuant to NAC 703.651.

(c) A petition.

(d) A prehearing conference.

(e) A workshop.

(f) A consumer session.

(g) A hearing.

-7
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



H+4 10. The provisions of this section do not apply to a quarterly adjustment to a base tariff
energy rate or a quarterly adjustment to a deferred energy accounting adjustment made pursuant
to NRS 704.110.

H24 11. The provisions of this section do not apply to a petition submitted to the
Commission pursuant to NAC 703.290.

Sec. 7. NAC 703.162 is hereby amended to read as follows:

A person who causes an application, tariff filing, complaint or petition described in
paragraphs (a), (b) and (c) of subsection H0} 9 of NAC 703.160 to be filed with the Commission
must include in the application, tariff, complaint or petition:

1. A draft of the public notice that complies with the provisions of paragraphs (a), (b) and
(c) of subsection 4 of NAC 703.160; and

2. A statement indicating whether a consumer session is required to be held pursuant to
NRS 704.069.

Sec. 8. NAC 703.296 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1. The Secretary of the Commission shall establish a list of natural persons and entities that
will be provided with copies of service of process and other documents in accordance with NAC
703.280 to 703.296, inclusive.

2. The Secretary shall make the list available for viewing on the Commission’s website

fregularly-publish-neticesfor} and provide the opportunity fef} for other natural persons and

entities to be included on the list established pursuant to this section. {Sueh-anotice-of

3. The Secretary shall include on the list established pursuant to this section each natural

person and entity that submits to the Commission a written request to be included on the list.

8-
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



4. The Secretary shall include on the list established pursuant to this section an electronic
mail address for each natural person and entity on the list.

Sec. 9. NAC 703.570 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1. A party to a proceeding who desires to contest fa-petitions} an order to show cause or a
complaint or make any representation about it to the Commission may file an answer with the
Commission.

2. An answer to an order to show cause or a complaint must:

(a) Be in writing; {and}

(b) Speeificallyadmitor-denylAdddress each material allegation fand-state-anynew-matter

(c) Separately state and number matters alleged by way of an affirmative defense.

3. If an amendment or correction to a pleading is filed before the filing of an answer, the
time within which to answer will be computed from the date of service of the amendment or
correction unless the Commission or presiding officer directs otherwise.

4. Except as otherwise ordered by the Commission, the facts set forth in an amendment or
correction shall be deemed admitted if an answer to the amendment or correction is not filed. If
a party does wish to answer an amendment or correction, the party must file an answer within 15
days after the service of the amendment or correction unless the Commission or presiding officer
directs otherwise.

5. Amendments or corrections made after the filing of an answer need not be answered.

6. Failure to file an answer or failure to indicate a jurisdictional defect in an answer does not

waive the right to object to a jurisdictional defect.

-9--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



Sec. 10. NAC 703.573 is hereby repealed.

Sec. 11. NAC 703.577 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1. A motion by a party, or by a person that filed a petition for leave to intervene, to dismiss
an application that is within the prohibition of paragraph (e) of subsection 1 of NRS 704.100
must be in writing and filed with the Commission no later than 15 days after the date fthe
apphieationisfiled-with-the Commission} set by the Commission for persons to file petitions for
leave to intervene.

2. The applicant, the Consumer’s Advocate and the Commission’s staff, if not the moving
party, may respond to the motion within 7 days after it is filed. The response must be in writing.

3. The Commission will hold a hearing on the motion no later than 5 days after the time for
response has expired and will render a decision on the motion within 30 days after the date the
fepphication} motion is filed.

Sec. 12. NAC 704.225 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1. Except as otherwise provided in this subsection, each entity described in subsection 1 of
NRS 703.191 shall submit to the Commission an annual report on or before May 15 of the year
following the year for which the annual report is filed. A telecommunication provider is not

required to submit an annual report pursuant to this section and shall submit an annual report

pursuant to NAC 704.7483. {A-previdereflastresort-of basieserviee-which-is-authorized by-the

2. An entity submitting an annual report pursuant to subsection 1 shall include in the annual

report:

--10--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



(a) A statement of income;

(b) A balance sheet;

(c) A statement of intrastate revenue;

(d) The number of customers served by the entity; and

(e) Any additional information requested by the Commission pursuant to subsection 3.

3. The Commission may request that an entity submitting an annual report pursuant to
subsection 1 include in the annual report any additional information that the Commission deems
necessary for inclusion in the annual report.

Sec. 13. NAC 704.450 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1. The Commission hereby adopts by reference the National Electrical Safety Codef;+997

Edition(ANSEFC21997)} in the form most recently approved by the American National

Standards Institute and approved and published by the Institute of Electrical and Electronics
Engineers, Inc. unless the Commission gives notice that the most recent publication is not

suitable for this State pursuant to subsection 3.

2. The National Electrical Safety Code is available, {at} for a fcharge-0f$60-perecopy-for

nenmembers;} fee, upon request made to the Institute of Electrical and Electronics Engineers,
Inc., Customer Service, 445 Hoes Lane, P.O. Box 1331, Piscataway, New Jersey 08855-1331.

3. The Commission will review each revision of the publication adopted by reference
pursuant to subsection 1 to determine its suitability for this State. If the Commission
determines that the revision is not suitable for this State, it will hold a public hearing to review
its determination and give notice of that hearing within 6 months after the date of the

publication of the revision. If, after the hearing, the Commission does not revise its

11--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



determination, the Commission will give notice that the revision is not suitable for this State
within 30 days after the hearing. If the Commission does not give such notice, the revision
becomes part of the publication adopted by reference pursuant to subsection 1.

Sec. 14. NAC 704.461 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1. The Commission hereby adopts by reference Standard No. 58 {1995-editien)} and
Standard No. 59 {1995-editien)-of} in the form most recently published by the National Fire
Protection Association unless the Commission gives notice that the most recent publication is
not suitable for this State pursuant to subsection 3.

2. Copies of these standards are available from the National Fire Protection Association,

One Batterymarch Park, P.O. Box 9101, Quincy, Massachusetts 02269-9101 for a fee. Fhe—cost

3. The Commission will review each revision of the publication adopted by reference

pursuant to subsection 1 to determine its suitability for this State. If the Commission
determines that the revision is not suitable for this State, it will hold a public hearing to review
its determination and give notice of that hearing within 6 months after the date of the
publication of the revision. If, after the hearing, the Commission does not revise its
determination, the Commission will give notice that the revision is not suitable for this State
within 30 days after the hearing. If the Commission does not give such notice, the revision
becomes part of the publication adopted by reference pursuant to subsection 1.

Sec. 15. NAC 704.569 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1. Except as otherwise provided in this section, a public utility that is required to maintain a
fire hydrant pursuant to NRS 704.660 shall:

(a) Maintain the fire hydrant in compliance with:

—-12--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



(1) The International Fire Code; and

(2) The Uniform Plumbing Code.

(b) Inspect and operate the fire hydrant:
(1) Not less than once each year; and
(2) Not later than 3 days after receiving notice that the fire hydrant is not in compliance

with the International Fire Code or the Uniform Plumbing Code.

(c) If the utility discovers that the fire hydrant is not in compliance with the International Fire

Code or the Uniform Plumbing Code, the utility shall, not later than 24 hours after the discovery:

(1) Notify the local agency having jurisdiction over fire protection;
(2) Install and maintain on the fire hydrant an out-of-service ring or bag that is approved
by the local agency having jurisdiction over fire protection; and
(3) Repair the fire hydrant as soon as practicable, but in any case, not later than 30 days
after discovery of the noncompliance unless the local agency having jurisdiction over fire
protection agrees to a later date for the completion of the repairs and the utility notifies the
Commission of the agreement.
(d) Paint and maintain the fire hydrant in a color scheme that is approved by the local agency
having jurisdiction over fire protection.
(e) Obtain the approval of the local agency having jurisdiction over fire protection and the
Commission before removing a fire hydrant from service.
(f) If the local agency having jurisdiction over fire protection has established a plan for
inspecting fire hydrants, coordinate the utility’s inspections with the local agency.

2. The Commission hereby adopts by reference:

I

13-
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



(a) The International Fire Code, 2006 edition, published by the International Code Council.

The publication may be obtained from the International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue,

N.W., 6th Floor, Washington, D.C. 20001-2070, by telephone at (800) 422-7233, or at the

Internet address http://www.iccsafe.org for a fee. {Theprice—ofthepublication—is—$64-00—for
members-and-$8550-for nonmembers:}

3. The Commission will review each revision of the publications adopted by reference
pursuant to subsection 2 to determine its suitability for this State. If the Commission determines
that the revision is not suitable for this State, it will hold a public hearing to review its
determination and give notice of that hearing within 6 months after the date of the publication of
the revision. If, after the hearing, the Commission does not revise its determination, the
Commission will give notice that the revision is not suitable for this State within 30 days after
the hearing. If the Commission does not give such notice, the revision becomes part of the
publication adopted by reference pursuant to subsection 2.

Sec. 16. NAC 704.640 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1. The Commission hereby adopts by reference the regulations contained in 18 C.F.R. Parts
201 and 204 fas-theseregulations-existonApri152009} in the form most recently published by
the United States Government Printing Office. The volume containing the Uniform System of
Accounts for Natural Gas Companies is available by mail from the Superintendent of
Documents, United States Government Printing Office, P.O. Box 979050, St. Louis, Missouri
63197-9000, by toll-free telephone at (866) 512-1800 or on the Internet at
http://bookstore.gpo.gov, for {the-price-o£$68} a fee. The volume may be accessed free of charge
on the Internet at http://www.gpoaccess.gov/cfr/index.html.

1

--14--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



Commission-will review-therevision} The Commission will review each revision of the

publication adopted by reference pursuant to subsection 1 to determine its suitability for this
State. If the Commission determines that the revision is not suitable for this State, the
Commission will hold a public hearing to review its determination and give notice of that
hearing within 6 months after the date of the publication of the revision. If, after the hearing, the
Commission does not revise its determination, the Commission will give notice that the revision
is not suitable for this State within 30 days after the hearing. If the Commission does not give
such notice, the revision becomes part of the publication adopted by reference pursuant to
subsection 1.

Sec. 17. NAC 704.650 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1. The Commission hereby adopts by reference the regulations contained in 18 C.F.R. Parts
41, 101 and 290 fas-theseregulations-existon-Apri1;2009} in the form most recently
published by the United States Government Printing Office. The volume containing 18 C.F.R.
1-399 is available by mail from the Superintendent of Documents, United States Government
Printing Office, P.O. Box 979050, St. Louis, Missouri 63197-9000, by toll-free telephone at
(866) 512-1800 or on the Internet at http://bookstore.gpo.gov, for a fee {the-price-e£$68}. The
volume may be accessed free of charge on the Internet at

http://www.gpoaccess.gov/cfr/index.html.

Commission-wilreview-therevision] The Commission will review each revision of the

publication adopted by reference pursuant to subsection 1 to determine its suitability for this

State. If the Commission determines that the revision is not suitable for this State, the

-15--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



Commission will hold a public hearing to review its determination and give notice of that
hearing within 6 months after the date of the publication of the revision. If, after the hearing, the
Commission does not revise its determination, the Commission will give notice that the revision
is not suitable for this State within 30 days after the hearing. If the Commission does not give
such notice, the revision becomes part of the publication adopted by reference pursuant to
subsection 1.

Sec. 18. NAC 704.7559 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1. Statement E must contain the applicant’s assurance to the Commission that the:

(a) Applicant has allocated its expenses, including all taxes and investment in the rate base,
according to the standards set forth in the Federal Communications Commission’s Separations
Manual, 47 C.F.R. 67.1, or as otherwise directed by the Commission. The manual is hereby
adopted by reference fas-it-existed-enJune 15,1985} in the form most recently adopted by the
Federal Communications Commission. A copy of the manual may be obtained from the
National Association of State Utility Regulatory Commissioners, Interstate Commerce
Commission Building, P.O. Box 684, Washington, D.C. 20044-0684, for {the-price-of$2.56} a
fee.

(b) Studies of cost which it used in the preparation of the application are available for
inspection at a single, identified location.

(c) Applicant’s employees and consultants who participated in the preparation of the
application will be made available, upon request, to aid the Commission’s staff and the
Consumer’s Advocate.

2. The applicant’s working papers must fully disclose the source and method of calculation

of all allocations which are used in adjustments and are related to the effect of divestiture.

--16--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



Sec. 19. NAC 704.803 is hereby amended to read as follows:
The Commission hereby adopts by reference:

1.  Energy Standard 90.1, 2001 User’s Manual, published by the American Society of

Heating, Refrigeration and Air-Conditioning Engineers, fas-the-manual-existed-onJanuaryt;

20061} in the form most recently published by the American Society of Heating, Refrigeration

and Air-Conditioning Engineers. A copy of this publication may be obtained from ASHRAE,
Publication Sales Department, 1791 Tullie Circle, N.E., Atlanta, Georgia 30329-2305, for fthe

price of $74 for members and $93 for nonmembers a fee.

2. The {2606} International Energy Conservation Code, published by the International Code

Council in the form most recently published by the International Code Council. This code may
be obtained from the International Code Council, 5203 Leesburg Pike, Suite 600, Falls Church,
Virginia 22041-3401, or at the Internet address http://www.iccsafe.org, for {the-price-of$25-for
i R (12

Sec. 20. NAC 704.8775 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1. The provisions of 18 C.F.R. §§ 292.101 to 292.207, inclusive, are hereby adopted by
reference Las-those-provisions-existed-onApri-199H in the form most recently published by
the U.S. Government Printing Office.

2. A copy of those provisions may be obtained from the Commission at its offices, for fthe

price of 25 cents per pagel a fee.

—-17--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



LEGISLATIVE REVIEW OF ADOPTED REGULATIONS--NRS 233B.066
Informational Statement
LCB File No. T008-14

A clear and concise explanation of the need for the adopted regulation.

The regulation improves processes and procedures of the Public Utilities Commission of
Nevada (“PUCN?”), updates certain provisions adopting publications by reference, and
clarifies a provision pertaining to annual report filings by providers of last resort of basic
telecommunication services.

Description of how public comment was solicited, a summary of public response, and
an explanation of how other interested persons may obtain a copy of the summary.

(a) Copies of the proposed regulation, notice of intent to act upon the regulation and notice
of workshop and hearing were sent by U.S. mail and email to persons who were known to
have an interest in the subjects of noticing and interventions. These documents were also
made available at the website of the PUCN, http://puc.nv.gov, mailed to all county libraries
in Nevada, published in the following newspapers:

Ely Times

Las Vegas Review Journal
Nevada Appeal

Reno Gazette Journal
Tonopah Times-Bonanza,

and posted at the following locations:

Public Utilities Commission Public Utilities Commission

1150 East William Street 9075 West Diablo Drive, Suite 250
Carson City, Nevada 89701 Las Vegas, Nevada 89148

First Judicial District Court Second Judicial District Court

885 East Musser Street 75 Court Street

Carson City, Nevada 89701 Reno, Nevada 89501

Eighth Judicial District Court
Regional Justice Center

200 Lewis Avenue

Las Vegas, Nevada 89155

(b) The PUCN held five rounds of comments, a workshop on May 9, 2012, a workshop on
January 14, 2015, and a hearing on January 20, 2015, to solicit public response. Most of
the participants support the temporary regulation as adopted. In the latest round of
comments, Nevada Press Association suggested publishing links to two of the PUCN-
maintained resources in newspapers in addition to publishing the resources on the PUCN
website. Telecommunications providers participating in the workshop, which included

—-18--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



AT&T Companies, CenturyLink, TW Telecom of Nevada, and Nevada
Telecommunications Association, objected to Nevada Press Association’s suggestion. The
PUCN did not incorporate Nevada Press Association’s suggestion in the proposed
regulation for reasons stated at the January 14, 2015, workshop.

Also in the latest round of comments, Charter Fiberlink expressed concern over changes to
the commenter status in the proposed regulation. Charter Fiberlink stated that the changes
can be confusing. Upon raising the issue at the workshop and soliciting responses from the
participants, which, in addition to telecommunications providers mentioned above,
included the Attorney General’s Bureau of Consumer Protection, the Regulatory
Operations Staff of the PUCN, and Southwest Gas Corporation, the PUCN concluded that
the PUCN’s existing noticing practices alleviate Charter Fiberlink’s concern.

(c) Copies of the transcripts of the proceedings are available for review at the offices of the
PUCN, 1150 East William Street, Carson City, Nevada 89701 and 9075 West Diablo
Drive, Suite 250, Las Vegas, Nevada 89148.

The number of persons who:

(a) Attended each hearing: May 9, 2012 — 8; January 14, 2015 - 7;
January 20, 2015 -5

(b) Testified at each hearing: May 9, 2012 - 8; January 14, 2015 -7;
January 20, 2015 - 4

(¢) Submitted written comments: 14

For each person identified in paragraphs (b) and (c) of number 3 above, the following
information if provided to the agency conducting the hearing:

(a) Name;

(b) Telephone number;

(¢c) Business address;

(d) Business telephone number;
(e) Electronic mail address; and

() Name of entity or organization represented.

Dan Jacobsen

Attorney General’s Bureau of Consumer Protection
100 North Carson Street

Carson City, Nevada 89701

(775) 684-1295

Djacobsen@ag.nv.gov

--19--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



Catherine Mazzeo

Southwest Gas Corporation
5241 Spring Mountain Road
Las Vegas, Nevada 89150
(702) 876-7250
catherine.mazzeo(@swgas.com

Barry Smith

Nevada Press Association
102 North Curry Street
Carson City, Nevada 89703
(775) 885-0866
nevadapress@att.net

Roger Moffitt

AT&T Companies

645 East Plumb Lane, Room B132
Reno, Nevada 89502

(775) 333-3114
roger.moffitt@att.com

Torry Somers

CenturyLink

6700 Via Austi Parkway

Las Vegas, Nevada 89119

(702) 244-8100
torry.r.somers@centurylink.com

Mike Eifert

Nevada Telecommunications Association
P.O. Box 34449

Reno, Nevada 89533

Eifert.nta@att.net

(775) 827-0191

Donald Brookhyser

Nevada Independent Energy Coalition
1300 SW Fifth, Suite 1750

Portland, Oregon 97210

(503) 402-8702

deb@a-klaw.com

--20--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



Steven Tackes

TW Telecom of Nevada LLC
510 West Fourth Street
Carson City, NV 89703
(775) 884-8306
stackes@kcnvlaw.com

Charlie Born

Frontier Communications
9260 East Stockton Blvd.
Elk Grove, California 95624
(916) 686-3570
charlie.born@ftr.com

Charles Hudak

Charter Fiberlink NV-CCVIIL, LLC
Three Ravinia Drive

Suite 1700

Atlanta, Georgia 30346

(770) 399-9500

Angel De Fazio

P.O. Box 29194

Las Vegas, Nevada 89126
ntefusa@aol.com

Fred Voltz

1805 North Carson Street, #231
Carson City, Nevada 89701
zebedee-177@yahoo.com

Elizabeth Elliot

Sierra Pacific Power Company d/b/a NV Energy and
Nevada Power Company d/b/a NV Energy

6226 West Sahara Avenue

Las Vegas, Nevada 89151

(702) 402-5697

dbrooks@nvenergy.com

Tammy Cordova

Regulatory Operations Staff of the PUCN
1150 East William Street

Carson City, Nevada 89701

(775) 684-6124

uttinger@puc.nv.gov

-21--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



10.

11.

A description of how comment was solicited from affected businesses, a summary of
their response and an explanation of how other interested persons may obtain a copy
of the summary.

Comments were solicited from affected businesses in the same manner as they were
solicited from the public.

The summary may be obtained as instructed in the response to question 2(c).

If the regulation was adopted without changing any part of the proposed regulation, a
summary of the reasons for adopting the regulation without change.

The proposed regulation has undergone numerous changes from its inception as a result of
public comments received.

The estimated economic effect of the regulation on the business which it is to regulate
and on the public. These must be stated separately, and in each case must include:
both adverse and beneficial effects, and both immediate and long-term effects.

(a) Estimated economic effect on the businesses which they are to regulate.
The regulation does not regulate any businesses.
(b) Estimated economic effect on the public which they are to regulate.

The regulation does not regulate the public.

The estimated cost to the agency for enforcement of the proposed regulation:

Any costs associated with the regulation are considered incremental in nature.

A description of any regulations of other State or governmental agencies which the
regulation overlaps or duplicates and a statement explaining why the duplication or
overlap is necessary. If the regulation overlaps or duplicates a federal regulation, the
name of the regulating federal agency.

The regulation does not overlap any other local, State, or Federal regulations.

If the regulation includes provisions that are more stringent than a federal regulation
that regulates the same activity, a summary of such provisions.

N/A

If the regulation provides a new fee or increases an existing fee, the total annual
amount the agency expects to collect and the manner in which the money will be used.

N/A

-20--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



12.

If the proposed regulation is likely to impose a direct and significant burden upon a
small business or directly restrict the formation, operation or expansion of a small
business, what methods did the agency use in determining the impact of the regulation
on a small business?

The Regulatory Operations Staff (“Staff””) of the Commission conducted a Delphi Method
exercise to determine the impact of this proposed regulation on small businesses. The
Delphi Method is a systematic, interactive, forecasting method based on independent inputs
of selected experts. In this instance, the participants were members of Staff. Each
participant in the exercise used his background and expertise to reflect upon and analyze
the impact of the proposed regulation on small businesses. Based upon Staff’s analysis,
Staff recommended to the Commission that the Commission find that the proposed
regulation will not impose a direct and significant economic burden on small businesses or
directly restrict the formation, operation or expansion of a small business. The
Commission accepted Staff’s recommendation and found that the proposed regulation does
not impose a direct or significant economic burden upon small businesses, nor does it
directly restrict the formation, operation, or expansion of a small business, and therefore a
small business impact statement pursuant to NRS 233B.0608(2) is not required. This
finding was memorialized in an Order issued in Docket No. 12-02013 on December 19,
2014.

-23--
Agency Draft of Adopted Temporary Regulation T008-14



